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8th Grader 

I am a girl. I was born in September. I live in 
Phillipsburg. I have two sisters. My eyes are 
green. My favorite colors are purple and light 
blue. Volleyball is my favorite sport. My 
favorite condiment is ketchup. Water is my 
favorite drink. My favorite snack is popcorn. I 
like watching movies. My goal for this school 
year is to get all A’s or make it to A team or B 
team in volleyball. Who am I?

5th Grader 

I am a boy. I was born in May. I live in 
Phillipsburg. I have two brothers. My eyes are 
blue. My favorite color is red. Baseball is my 
favorite sport. My favorite condiment is 
Freddy’s sauce. Baja Blast Mountain Dew is 
my favorite drink. My favorite snack is chips. I 
like playing video games. My goal for this 
school year is to get all A’s. Who am I?

Secret Staff Member 😎  

I am a man. I was born in February. I live in 
Phillipsburg. I am an only child. My eyes are 
blue. My favorite color is bright green. Football 
and wrestling are my favorite sports. My 
favorite condiment is Baja Chipotle sauce. Dr. 
Pepper is my favorite drink. My favorite snack 
is beef jerky. I like watching movies. My goal 
for this school year is to start working out in 
the evenings. Who am I?

6th Grader  

I am a girl. I was born in September. I live in 
Phillipsburg. I am an only child. My eyes are 
dark brown. My favorite color is blue. My 
favorite sport is volleyball. My favorite 
condiment is Chick-fil-A sauce. Coca-Cola is 
my favorite drink. My favorite snack is chips. I 
like watching movies. My goal for this school 
year is to get all A’s. Who am I?

7th Grader  

I am a boy. I was born in April. I live outside of 
Phillipsburg. I have two brothers. My eyes are 
brown. My favorite color is navy. Football is my 
favorite sport. My favorite condiment is 
ketchup. Protein shakes are my favorite drink. 
My favorite snack is extra cheddar goldfish. I 
like watching movies. My goal for this school 
year is to help my team go undefeated in 
football. Who am I?
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THIS WEEK'S SECRET 
STUDENTS

New Year Inspires PJH Students to Set Goals and Make Plans 

Happy New Year! We had a couple questions for you heading into the new year–what’s your 
goal and what are you looking forward to? You had some inspiring answers!
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Neelee Taylor, Jemma Thomas, Vanessa Van Allen, Kason Wisinger

"Get my AR goal 
before my friends 

so that I can 
brag."

-Jordan Kaup

"Beat my 
brother at 

something"

-Natalie Van 
Allen

"To get 
maximum 

aura."

-Kanon Bilbrey

"Make new 
friends and 

get rid of the 
fake ones."

-Lea Smith

"Get better 
at ping 
pong."

-Clayton Gal

"Be nice to 
the boys 
(even 

Hudson)."

-Sydney 
Ghiardi

"Go 
undefeated 

in 
basketball."

-Zach 
Springer

"Be more 
responsible, 
pray every 

night, and do 
better in 
school."

-Charley Jarvis

"Freshman 
year of high 

school."

-Marchall 
Russel

"Seeing my papa 
and grammie after 
school ends and 

fair over the 
summer."

-Kinley Krafft

"I’m looking 
forward to 

track."

-Carter Dusin

"I am looking 
forward to 

Spring Break 
already."

-Zoey Griffin

"Playing 
Fortnite."

-Eli 
Mooney

"Summerrrrr!"

-Emry 
Hindman

"Getting 
my 

phone."

-Cory 
Taylor

"Seeing my 
Mom."

-Ally Riener

What is your 
goal for the new 

year?

What are you 
looking 

forward to?
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